
                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 05/17/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -30938-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600750                                         DBE GOAL:  3.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION                                 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   7,971,000.00 
CALL: 370                 ROUTE: ST 1001                                             LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON RIDGE ROAD FROM SR 53 TO 200 FEET EAST OF CONNECTICUT 
                                 STREET 
                         COUNTY: LAKE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $  5,946,621.87 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1000263  | GATLIN PLUMBING & HEATING INC  | GRIFFITH                     | $  6,598,451.12 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-924-6972 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1068009  | DYER CONSTRUCTION CO           | DYER                         | $  6,423,923.11 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-865-2961 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1569222  | GRIMMER CONSTRUCTION INC       | HIGHLAND                     | $  5,583,750.72 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         219-924-1623 |                 |    |   |        DBE  3.21% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2364802  | HASSE CONSTRUCTION CO INC      | CALUMET CITY                 | $  6,398,505.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Illinois        708-862-2450 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 2 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 05/17/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -31931-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710198                                         DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES                          ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     NONE BELOW 
CALL: 440                 ROUTE:                                                     LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ALONG GARDEN STREET, COLUMBIA STREET, 
                                 AND MIAMI AVENUE 
                         COUNTY: CASS 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $    301,393.00 |R   |   |       REJECTED * 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0997978  | PHEND & BROWN INC              | MILFORD                      | $    238,718.20 |R   |   |       REJECTED * 
            |                                | Indiana         574-658-4166 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC               | ANDERSON                     | $    229,500.00 |R   |   |       REJECTED *         
            |                                | Indiana         765-643-5358 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1460625  | LEO BROWN CONSTRUCTION CO      | LOGANSPORT                   | $    290,004.78 |R   |   |       REJECTED * 
            |                                | Indiana         574-753-2511 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1817530  | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC         | ALBION                       | $    304,398.40 |R   |   |       REJECTED * 
            |                                | Indiana         260-636-3000 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - REJECTED, TO BE RESCOPED AND READVERTISED. 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 3 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 05/17/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT B -30580-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400716                                         DBE GOAL:  5.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT                                  ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     972,000.00 
CALL: 760                 ROUTE:                                                     LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON GRAND BOULEVARD OVER DEEP RIVER 
 
                         COUNTY: LAKE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-1710683  | ELLAS CONSTRUCTION CO LLC      | MUNSTER                      | $  1,626,358.34 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-746-0983 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-3919039  | TONN AND BLANK CONSTRUCTION LL | MICHIGAN CITY                | $  1,345,264.35 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-879-7321 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $  1,780,897.65 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035114  | SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO       | GARY                         | $  1,382,399.13 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-886-3728 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035122  | GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC     | GARY                         | $  1,787,000.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-887-5233 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1106884  | ELLAS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC | GARY                         | $  1,715,158.63 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-938-0860 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1523985  | WIRTZ & YATES INC              | KENTLAND                     | $  1,504,624.70 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-474-6542 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-0872360  | ALBIN CARLSON & CO             | ADDISON                      | $  1,181,796.51 |R   | X |        AWARD * 
            |                                | Illinois        630-785-4000 |                 |    |   |        DBE  5.09% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3253376  | DUNNET BAY CONSTRUCTION COMPAN | GLENDALE HEIGHTS             | $  1,340,352.98 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Illinois        630-539-1200 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED. 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 4 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 05/17/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT B -31645-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0501011                                         DBE GOAL:  5.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT                                  ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     866,000.00 
CALL: 790                 ROUTE: 400E                                                CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON CR 400E OVER CROYS CREEK 
 
                         COUNTY: CLAY 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
05-0558668  | WEDDLE BROTHERS HIGHWAY GROUP  | BLOOMINGTON                  | $    775,161.34 |R   |   |        IRREGULAR * 
            |                                | Indiana         812-339-9500 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1310611  | DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC           | FRANKLIN                     | $    651,361.71 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         317-736-6024 |                 |    |   |        DBE  6.28% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1381845  | GEORGE R HARVEY & SON INC      | DANVILLE                     | $    738,226.38 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-745-5169 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1385672  | FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC      | COLUMBUS                     | $    835,126.31 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-372-8441 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1618530  | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE               | $    919,102.92 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-280-4404 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1801998  | CLR INC                        | VINCENNES                    | $    707,721.09 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-886-0360 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
*FAILED TO SUBMIT A PERFORMANCE BOND AND POWER OF ATTORNEY LETTER WITH THE BID.  BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(1). 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 05/05/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT IR-30128-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710755; 0710750; 0710751                       DBE GOAL:  4.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION                               ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   7,816,702.02 
CALL: 180                 ROUTE: 31                                                  LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 31 FROM 2.4 MILES SOUTH OF US 20 TO 1.4 MILES 
                                 SOUTH OF US 20 (RP 234+0070) 
                         COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE/FAX     AMOUNT OF BID    TYPE   LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             | $    599,632.90 |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 |                             |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             | $    374,947.73 |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                |                             |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | SECTION 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS       |                             | $          7.00 |      |  X  | AWARD * 
            |                                         |                             |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION                | SOUTH BEND    574-288-8321  | $  2,976,407.11 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION                | SOUTH BEND    574-288-8321  | $  3,193,535.72 | R    |  X  | AWARD * 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | DBE  9.28% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION                | SOUTH BEND    574-288-8321  | $  2,889,166.01 | R    |  X  | AWARD * 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0997978  | PHEND & BROWN INC                       | MILFORD       574-658-4166  | $  2,702,298.26 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0997978  | PHEND & BROWN INC                       | MILFORD       574-658-4166  | $  3,459,347.33 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0997978  | PHEND & BROWN INC                       | MILFORD       574-658-4166  | $  3,590,230.25 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1120685  | WALSH & KELLY INC                       | SOUTH BEND    574-288-4811  | $  2,736,502.00 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1120685  | WALSH & KELLY INC                       | SOUTH BEND    574-288-4811  |          NO BID |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1120685  | WALSH & KELLY INC                       | SOUTH BEND    574-288-4811  | $  3,834,626.21 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 2 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 05/05/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT IR-30128-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710755; 0710750; 0710751                       DBE GOAL:  4.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION                               ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   7,816,702.02 
CALL: 180                 ROUTE: 31                                                  LAPORTE DISTRICT 
(CONTINUED)            LOCATION: ON US 31 FROM 2.4 MILES SOUTH OF US 20 TO 1.4 MILES 
                                 SOUTH OF US 20 (RP 234+0070) 
                         COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE/FAX     AMOUNT OF BID    TYPE   LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | LAPORTE       219-324-4320  |          NO BID |      |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | LAPORTE       219-324-4320  | $  3,830,813.09 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY              | LAPORTE       219-324-4320  | $  4,328,494.17 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2051611  | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC                    | BATTLE CREEK  269-965-1207  | $  3,243,072.64 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | MI                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2051611  | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC                    | BATTLE CREEK  269-965-1207  | $  3,725,782.90 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | MI                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2051611  | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC                    | BATTLE CREEK  269-965-1207  | $  4,215,547.30 | R    |     | 
            | SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS               | MI                          |                 |      |     | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE  
PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE, AND THE COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002,  
SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. (BIDS ON SECTION 0004 ARE FIXED BY INDOT FOR ALL BIDDERS.) 
 
* INITIAL CONTRACT AMOUNT = SUM OF SECTIONS 0002, 0003, AND 0004 = $  6,082,708.73 
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                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 04/29/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT IR-30692-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600304                                         DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ADDED TRAVEL LANES                                 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: $50,650,000.00 (A + B) 
CALL: 194                 ROUTE: 65                                                  CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON I-65 FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF CR 100E TO US 52 
 
                         COUNTY: BOONE 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE        AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             | $ 3,359,261.45 |   |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 |                             |                |   |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             | $ 2,586,127.64 |   |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                |                             |                |   |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | SECTION 0003 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS       |                             | $        10.00 | R | X | 
            |                                         |                             |                |   |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION                | SOUTH BEND    574-288-8321  |         NO BID |   |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                |   |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION                | SOUTH BEND    574-288-8321  | $41,162,800.00 | R | X |   AWARD  DBE 6.17% 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                |   |   |A + B = $ 41,455,610.00 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP                | COLUMBUS      800-854-1830  | $42,091,280.00 | R |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                |   |   |A + B = $ 42,309,690.00 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP                | COLUMBUS      800-854-1830  | $43,831,380.00 | R |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                |   |   |A + B = $ 44,049,790.00 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9996209  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION CO/E & B PAVING J/V  | LAPORTE       219-324-4320  |         NO BID |   |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA OPTION                 | IN                          |                |   |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9996209  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION CO/E & B PAVING J/V  | LAPORTE       219-324-4320  | $48,769,760.39 | R |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 PCCP OPTION                | IN                          |                |   |   |A + B = $ 49,132,070.39 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
NOTE: RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF PART "A" (EITHER PAVEMENT SECTION OPTION 0001 OR 0002, PLUS SECTION 3),  
PART "B" (COST FOR PROPOSED ROAD CLOSURE DAYS), AND THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 2 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 04/29/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -29983-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710201                                         DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: SAFE ROUTE TO SCHOOL                                ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     823,000.00 
CALL: 320                 ROUTE:                                                     SEYMOUR DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ALONG US 421, SR 350 AND CR 450N TO 
                                 JAC-CEN-DEL SCHOOL CORPORATION 
                         COUNTY: RIPLEY 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1357381  | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC      | NORTH VERNON                 | $    947,425.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-346-4135 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1609544  | SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO            | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $  1,141,041.48 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-484-1500 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1817574  | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE            | ANDERSON                     | $    971,790.50 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         765-378-5783 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $    874,999.15 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1976296  | LYKINS CONTRACTING INC         | SUNMAN                       | $    925,847.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-623-2244 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2155873  | KINGS TRUCKING & EXCAVATION IN | SEYMOUR                      | $    778,333.15 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         812-522-6973 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 3 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 04/29/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT B -30012-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005898, 0500082                                DBE GOAL:  4.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT AND DAM CONSTRUCTION             ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   2,230,000.00 
CALL: 750                 ROUTE: 250S                                                LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON CR 250S OVER RAIN CREEK, 0.07 MILE EAST OF WABASH AVE 
                                 AND CR 500E 
                         COUNTY: FULTON 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                     | FORT WAYNE                   | $  1,784,486.26 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         260-478-1548 |                 |    |   |        DBE  4.02% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2675420  | ANLAAN CORPORATION             | SPRING LAKE                  | $  1,941,046.16 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        616-846-8442 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-3806996  | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC           | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $  2,533,050.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-284-1195 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 04/27/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -29617-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9999250                                         DBE GOAL:  5.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITY                ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     578,000.00 
CALL: 300                 ROUTE:                                                     SEYMOUR DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ALONG CRESTVIEW AVENUE FROM SR 62 TO INDIAN CREEK 
 
                         COUNTY: HARRISON 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1487672  | MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING  | NEW ALBANY                   | $    677,069.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-941-7895 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1618530  | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE               | $    861,336.55 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-280-4404 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1705051  | TRIPLETT STRIPING INC          | CLARKSVILLE                  | $    634,023.80 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-948-6691 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1878024  | RAGLE INC                      | NEWBURGH                     | $    534,997.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         812-853-9558 |                 |    |   |        DBE  5.01% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2005079  | FULKERSON CONTRACTING INC      | LANESVILLE                   | $    674,723.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-952-2662 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040699  | EXCEL EXCAVATING INC           | JEFFERSONVILLE               | $  1,105,000.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-246-0857 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  | $    638,847.50 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 04/27/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -31172-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500974                                         DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION                                 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   3,870,000.00 
CALL: 390                 ROUTE:                                                     CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON MARGARET AVENUE FROM US 41 TO 7TH STREET 
 
                         COUNTY: VIGO 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1357381  | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC      | NORTH VERNON                 | $  4,096,425.54 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-346-4135 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $  3,899,590.46 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $  4,144,620.74 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
37-0797609  | FEUTZ CONTRACTORS INC          | PARIS                        | $  3,742,712.95 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Illinois        217-465-8402 |                 |    |   |        DBE  6.07% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 04/27/11 
                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
                                                                                                MBE GOAL:  0.00 
CONTRACT RS-33717-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006081                                         WBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: WEDGE AND LEVEL                                     ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     238,500.00 
CALL: 650                 ROUTE:                                                     CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ON PURDUE CAMPUS 
 
                         COUNTY: TIPPECANOE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $    254,793.00 |R   | X |        AWARD * 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $    308,906.08 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00. 
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                                                 FOR THE LETTING OF April 13, 2011 
                                                                                                MBE GOAL:  0.00 
CONTRACT M -33801-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172321                                         WBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE, MOWING                        ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $      68,300.00 
CALL: 810                 ROUTE: 52                                                  CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 52, FROM US 24 TO NORTH LIMITS OF I-65 INTERCHANGE AND 
                                 US 231 AND FROM US 52N TO I-65 
                         COUNTY: BENTON       BOONE         CLINTON       TIPPECANOE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1606893  | OLCO INC                       | BATESVILLE                   | $     93,979.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-934-4574 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2154772  | COMPTONS MOWING SERVICE INC    | STAR CITY                    | $     81,643.00 |R   | X |        AWARD * 
            |                                | Indiana         574-595-7370 |                 |    |   |        DBE 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00. 
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CONTRACT T -33677-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005550                                         DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW SIGNAL INSTALLATION                             ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     114,100.00 
CALL: 870                 ROUTE: 46                                                  CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 46 AT HULMAN DRIVE 
 
                         COUNTY: VIGO 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
06-1675328  | MARTELL ELECTRIC LLC           | SOUTH BEND                   | $    137,897.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-271-5000 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0821499  | JAMES H DREW CORPORATION       | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    133,066.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-876-3739 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1262778  | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC        | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    127,248.20 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-545-7641 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1657131  | MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC       | PLYMOUTH                     | $    113,202.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         574-936-8613 |                 |    |   |        
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT T -33689-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006020                                         DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW TRAFFIC SIGNAL                                  ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $      82,000.00 
CALL: 880                 ROUTE: 136                                                 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: AT US 136 AND RONALD REAGAN PARKWAY 
 
                         COUNTY: HENDRICKS 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
06-1675328  | MARTELL ELECTRIC LLC           | SOUTH BEND                   | $     94,949.49 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-271-5000 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0392360  | HOOSIER COMPANY INC            | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $     81,859.30 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-872-8125 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0821499  | JAMES H DREW CORPORATION       | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $     89,400.95 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-876-3739 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1262778  | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC        | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $     75,674.47 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-545-7641 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1657131  | MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC       | PLYMOUTH                     | $     71,097.94 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         574-936-8613 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2046222  | MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC       | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $     89,864.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-356-9250 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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                                                                                                MBE GOAL:  0.00 
CONTRACT TM-31548-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800491                                         WBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: SIGNING INSTALLATION / REPAIR                       ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     290,000.00 
CALL: 920                 ROUTE: I-70                                                CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ALONG I-70, I-65, AND I-74 WITHIN 
                                 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                         COUNTY: VARIOUS 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
06-1675328  | MARTELL ELECTRIC LLC           | SOUTH BEND                   | $    171,977.50 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-271-5000 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0392360  | HOOSIER COMPANY INC            | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    164,863.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         317-872-8125 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1262778  | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC        | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    246,833.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-545-7641 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1657131  | MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC       | PLYMOUTH                     | $    169,954.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-936-8613 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2046222  | MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC       | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    167,902.50 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-356-9250 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 
 


