

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 1

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT IR-34814-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129720700ST5

DBE GOAL: 12.00

DESCRIPTION: ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 100

ROUTE:

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG PATROL ROAD, 2.0 MILES EAST OF SR 62

COUNTY: FLOYD
 BIDDER

CODE	COUNTY: FLOYD BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1284281	DAN CRISTIANI EXCAVATING	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-9866	\$ 841,878.00			
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 908,576.75			
35-1801998	CLR INC	VINCENNES Indiana	812-886-0360	\$ 888,099.81			
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 923,142.00			
35-2040699	EXCEL EXCAVATING INC	SELLERSBURG Indiana	812-246-0857	\$ 1,121,424.12			
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 977,912.48			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 LETTING PLANHOLDERS LIST
 THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 1

CALL: 110

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT: IR-35602-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129868500ST3
 DESCRIPTION: ADDED TRAVEL LANES
 ROUTE: 31
 LOCATION: ON US 31, FROM 146TH STREET TO 203RD STREET

DBE GOAL: 11.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 69,316,000.00
 GREENFIELD DISTRICT
 ACE: \$ 79,713,400.00

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE			\$ 3,226,635.70			
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE			\$ 2,321,386.59			
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	INDIANAPOLIS IN	317-634-5561	44,510,689.51			
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	INDIANAPOLIS IN	317-634-5561	18,362,310.49			
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	INDIANAPOLIS IN	317-634-5561	No Bid			
35-1035114	SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	GARY IN	219-886-3728				
35-1035114	SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	GARY IN	219-886-3728				
35-1035114	SUPERIOR CONSTRUCTION CO INC SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	GARY IN	219-886-3728				
35-1111003	WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	CLINTON IN	765-832-8526	49,273,067.73			
35-1111003	WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	CLINTON IN	765-832-8526	No Bid			
35-1111003	WHITE CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	CLINTON IN	765-832-8526	23,273,803.77			
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	BOGGSTOWN IN	317-835-2254				
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	BOGGSTOWN IN	317-835-2254				
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	BOGGSTOWN IN	317-835-2254				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 LETTING PLANHOLDERS LIST
 THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 2

CALL: 110

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT: IR-35602-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 129868500ST3
 DESCRIPTION: ADDED TRAVEL LANES
 ROUTE: 31
 LOCATION: ON US 31, FROM 146TH STREET TO 203RD STREET

DBE GOAL: 11.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 69,316,000.00
 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

ACE: \$ 79,713,400.00

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	47,983,165.72			
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	No Bid			
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	25,289,430.84			
37-1047512	HALVERSON CONSTRUCTION CO INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	SPRINGFIELD IL	217-753-0027				
37-1047512	HALVERSON CONSTRUCTION CO INC SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	SPRINGFIELD IL	217-753-0027				
37-1047512	HALVERSON CONSTRUCTION CO INC SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	SPRINGFIELD IL	217-753-0027				
99-9996015	E & B PAVING/GRADEX J/V SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	ANDERSON IN	765-643-5358	46,350,038.62			
99-9996015	E & B PAVING/GRADEX J/V SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	ANDERSON IN	765-643-5358	19,448,626.10			
99-9996015	E & B PAVING/GRADEX J/V SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	ANDERSON IN	765-643-5358	20,095,330.03			
99-9996269	WALSH/MILESTONE US 31 J/V SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	48,648,548.66			
99-9996269	WALSH/MILESTONE US 31 J/V SECTION 0002 HMA ALTERNATE	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	No Bid			
99-9996269	WALSH/MILESTONE US 31 J/V SECTION 0003 PCCP ALTERNATE	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	18,879,622.09			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 2

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -31408-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0301166

DBE GOAL: 14.00

DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE AND PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 130

ROUTE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG THE WOLF LAKE AND FORSYTH TRAIL

CODE	COUNTY: LAKE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
26-3919039	TONN AND BLANK CONSTRUCTION LL	MICHIGAN CITY		\$ 1,433,442.71			
		Indiana	219-879-7321				
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN		\$ 1,189,316.08			
		Indiana	574-875-5183				
35-1035122	GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY		\$ 1,387,800.00			
		Indiana	219-887-5233				
35-1120685	WALSH & KELLY INC	GRIFFITH		\$ 1,350,521.20			
		Indiana	219-924-5900				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 3

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -32461-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900099

DBE GOAL: 9.00

DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,420,800.00

CALL: 140

ROUTE: 66

VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON RIVER ROAD FROM 0.21 MILE WEST OF SR 66 TO SR 66

COUNTY: PERRY
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
05-0558668	WEDDLE BROTHERS HIGHWAY GROUP	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-339-9500	\$ 1,584,424.07			
35-0958970	LUTGRING BROTHERS INC	TELL CITY Indiana	812-836-4300	\$ 1,258,900.00			
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 1,300,000.00			
35-1878024	RAGLE INC	NEWBURGH Indiana	812-853-9558	\$ 2,142,937.33			
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 1,092,000.00			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 4

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -32799-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800343

DBE GOAL: 11.00

DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 3,566,325.00

CALL: 150

ROUTE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SALISBURY ROAD FROM 250 FEET SOUTH OF WEST MAIN STREET
 TO 100 FEET NORTH OF NORTHWEST L STREET

COUNTY: WAYNE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0999231	HUNT PAVING COMPANY INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-241-8313	\$ 3,430,000.00			
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 2,957,957.00			
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 3,083,000.00			
35-2094565	3D COMPANY INC	MUNCIE Indiana	765-288-3326	\$ 3,097,658.89			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 5

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -33894-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005926

DBE GOAL: 10.00

DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE AND PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 726,000.00

CALL: 170

ROUTE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON THE ERIE LACKAWANNA TRAILHEAD

CODE	COUNTY: LAKE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
26-3919039	TONN AND BLANK CONSTRUCTION LL	MICHIGAN CITY		\$ 787,865.78			
		Indiana	219-879-7321				
35-0461550	LARSON DANIELSON CONSTRUCTION	LAPORTE		\$ 763,024.88			
		Indiana	219-362-2127				
35-1035122	GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY		\$ 697,800.00			
		Indiana	219-887-5233				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 6

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -34072-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902279

DBE GOAL: 14.00

DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE AND PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 948,000.00

CALL: 180

ROUTE:

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON MONROE STREET FROM US 33 TO EAST ENTRANCE OF FAIRGROUNDS

COUNTY: ELKHART
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 922,493.90			
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC	MILFORD Indiana	574-658-4166	\$ 1,085,429.55			
35-1120685	WALSH & KELLY INC	GRIFFITH Indiana	219-924-5900	\$ 953,019.42			
35-1185040	NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC	BRISTOL Indiana	574-848-4437	\$ 833,645.76			
35-1489621	HRP CONSTRUCTION INC	SOUTH BEND Indiana	574-271-7800	\$ 1,219,515.69			
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 1,093,397.50			
38-1625197	SELGE CONSTRUCTION CO INC	NILES Michigan	269-684-0842	\$ 813,422.58			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 7

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -34176-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006255

DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 190

ROUTE: 465

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG I-465, 3.50 MILES EAST OF SR 431

COUNTY: MARION
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1004746	TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P	SALEM		\$ 557,600.00			
		Indiana	812-883-6644				
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE	ANDERSON		\$ 1,762,038.00			
		Indiana	765-378-5783				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 8

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -34574-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173685

DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: SAFE ROUTE TO SCHOOL

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 188,000.00

CALL: 200

ROUTE:

CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON WASHINGTON STREET NEAR BAINBRIDGE ELEMENTARY

COUNTY: PUTNAM
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 254,000.00			
35-1606893	OLCO INC	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-933-0205	\$ 181,143.55			
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 198,797.75			
46-1982125	CRI CONSTRUCTION CO LLC	PIERCTON Indiana	260-327-3300	\$ 217,517.00			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 9

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -34775-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173205

DBE GOAL: 12.00

DESCRIPTION: SIDEWALK REHABILITATION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 356,000.00

CALL: 210

ROUTE: 23

LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG SR 23, BETWEEN CENTER STREET AND MAPLE AVENUE

COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0461550	LARSON DANIELSON CONSTRUCTION	LAPORTE Indiana	219-362-2127	\$ 322,635.58			
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 314,318.60			
35-1120685	WALSH & KELLY INC	GRIFFITH Indiana	219-924-5900	\$ 287,165.02			
35-1339168	LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I	LAPORTE Indiana	219-393-5555	\$ 361,411.18			
35-1817530	PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC	ALBION Indiana	260-636-3000	\$ 299,875.00			
38-1625197	SELGE CONSTRUCTION CO INC	NILES Michigan	269-684-0842	\$ 276,513.48			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 10

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -34799-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173272ER
 DESCRIPTION: SLIDE CORRECTION

DBE GOAL: 1.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 364,800.00
 VINCENNES DISTRICT

CALL: 220

ROUTE: 37
 LOCATION: ALONG OLD SR 37, 0.77 MILE NORTHEAST OF SR 37, BETWEEN
 SWEET GUM ROAD AND LEOPOLD ROAD

COUNTY: PERRY
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
20-1237324	KERNS EXCAVATING LLC	BICKNELL Indiana	812-291-5156	\$ 231,625.50			
35-0958970	LUTGRING BROTHERS INC	TELL CITY Indiana	812-836-4300	\$ 181,600.00			
35-1009310	DEIG BROTHERS LUMBER & CONSTR	EVANSVILLE Indiana	812-423-4201	\$ 348,838.00			
35-1057095	BLANKENBERGER BROTHERS INC	CYNTHIANA Indiana	812-845-2717	\$ 248,000.00			
35-1284120	KOBERSTEIN CONTRACTING INC	PRINCETON Indiana	812-385-2695	\$ 305,060.20			
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 211,439.50			
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 251,744.00			
35-1878024	RAGLE INC	NEWBURGH Indiana	812-853-9558	\$ 222,561.00			
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 197,800.00			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 11

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -35201-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297257

DBE GOAL: 10.00

DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 230

ROUTE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON MICHIGAN BLVD, FROM CARROLL AVENUE TO SR 212

COUNTY: LAPORTE
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN		\$ 5,678,994.45			
		Indiana	574-875-5183				
35-1058916	WOODRUFF & SONS INC	MICHIGAN CITY		\$ 5,998,888.88			
		Indiana	219-872-8605				
35-1120685	WALSH & KELLY INC	GRIFFITH		\$ 5,835,201.40			
		Indiana	219-924-5900				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 12

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -35270-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297536

DBE GOAL: 7.00

DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 864,400.00

CALL: 240

ROUTE: 46

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 46, FROM SR 229 TO BATESVILLE CORPORATION LINE

CODE	COUNTY: RIPLEY BIDDER	FRANKLIN ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0844079	PAUL H ROHE COMPANY	AURORA		\$ 704,775.41			
		Indiana	812-926-1471				
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON		\$ 768,094.75			
		Indiana	812-346-4135				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 13

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -35286-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173049, 1297537

DBE GOAL: 11.00

DESCRIPTION: ROAD REHABILITATION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 8,252,300.40

CALL: 250

ROUTE: SHADELAND AVENUE

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SHADELAND AVENUE FROM BROOKVILLE TO 21ST STREET

COUNTY: MARION
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN		\$ 6,933,000.00			
		Indiana	574-875-5183				
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC	BOGGSTOWN		\$ 7,612,785.09			
		Indiana	317-835-2254				
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON		\$ 7,304,671.01			
		Indiana	765-643-5358				
35-1609544	SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 8,169,404.64			
		Indiana	317-484-1500				
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS		\$ 7,888,777.73			
		Indiana	812-579-5248				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 14

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -35547-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297765
 DESCRIPTION: PATCH AND REHAB PAVEMENT

DBE GOAL: 0.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CALL: 260

ROUTE: 36
 LOCATION: ON US 36 AT US 35 AND ON US 36 AT SR 1

CODE	COUNTY: RANDOLPH BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 61,304.00			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 60,039.00			
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 66,551.50			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 15

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -35548-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297766

DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: PATCH AND REHAB PAVEMENT

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 270

ROUTE: 26

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 26 AT US 31 WESTBOUND APPROACH

COUNTY: HOWARD
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE		\$ 56,129.00			
		Indiana	260-478-1990				
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON		\$ 53,203.59			
		Indiana	765-643-5358				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 16

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT R -35605-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500142 DBE GOAL: 12.00
 DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT WITH NEW SIGNALS ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 CALL: 290 ROUTE: US 150 SEYMOUR DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON US 150 AT EDWARDSVILLE ROAD/GALENA ROAD (PECTOL ROAD)
 IN GALENA
 COUNTY: FLOYD

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 736,687.19			
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 749,600.00			
35-2040699	EXCEL EXCAVATING INC	SELLERSBURG Indiana	812-246-0857	\$ 968,207.68			
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 810,000.00			
61-1256623	LOUISVILLE PAVING CO	LOUISVILLE Kentucky	502-583-1726	\$ 904,372.95			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 17

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT RS-31504-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710395 DBE GOAL: 7.00
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,475,000.00
 CALL: 330 ROUTE: 421 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON US 421 FROM 0.13 MILE SOUTH OF SR 47 TO 0.50 MILE NORTH
 OF THE SOUTH JUNCTION OF SR 38
 COUNTY: BOONE CLINTON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 1,414,135.77			
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 1,610,909.26			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 1,572,669.29			
35-1151771	CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC	WHITESTOWN Indiana	317-769-1900	\$ 1,416,000.00			
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 1,457,250.00			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 18

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT RS-31620-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710397 DBE GOAL: 5.00
 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,600,000.00
 CALL: 340 ROUTE: 421 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
 LOCATION: ON US 421 FROM 1.75 MILES NORTH OF SR 75 TO THE NORTH
 JUNCTION OF SR 38
 COUNTY: CLINTON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 1,446,802.81			
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 1,576,257.32			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 1,620,346.83			
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 1,592,751.14			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 19

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT RS-31980-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900233

DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,300,000.00

CALL: 350

ROUTE: 50

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 50 FROM DUTCH HOLLOW ROAD TO SR 350

COUNTY: DEARBORN
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0844079	PAUL H ROHE COMPANY	AURORA		\$ 1,218,811.74			
		Indiana	812-926-1471				
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON		\$ 1,324,472.62			
		Indiana	812-346-4135				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 22

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT RS-35357-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297658

MBE GOAL: 7.00

DESCRIPTION: INSTITUTION AND PARK ROAD MAINTENANCE

WBE GOAL: 5.00

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 344,920.00

CALL: 380

ROUTE:

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT OUABACHE STATE PARK, J.E. ROUSH LAKE FISH & WILDLIFE AREA
 AND FORT WAYNE STATE POLICE POST

COUNTY: ALLEN WELLS HUNTINGTON
 BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1016737	WAYNE ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-747-7531	\$ 399,588.75			
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	\$ 331,106.50			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 341,965.42			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 23

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT RS-35943-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1382484
 CALL: 390 DESCRIPTION: PATCH AND REHAB PAVEMENT
 ROUTE: 62
 LOCATION: ON SR 62 FROM SR 129 TO SR 262

DBE GOAL: 3.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: DEARBORN BIDDER	RIPLEY ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0844079	PAUL H ROHE COMPANY	AURORA Indiana	812-926-1471	\$ 412,798.60			
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 444,227.53			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 24

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT B -29487-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0200729
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT

DBE GOAL: 4.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

CALL: 410

ROUTE: 725N
 LOCATION: ON CR 725N OVER EAST FORK OF WHITE RIVER

CODE	COUNTY: JACKSON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1385672	FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-372-8441	\$ 2,754,155.04			
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 2,802,093.27			
35-1878024	RAGLE INC	NEWBURGH Indiana	812-853-9558	\$ 3,495,446.72			
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 2,623,550.00			
37-1047512	HALVERSON CONSTRUCTION CO INC	SPRINGFIELD Illinois	217-753-0027	\$ 2,911,225.41			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 25

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT B -30964-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006048
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR
 CALL: 430 ROUTE: 64
 LOCATION: ON I-64 OVER SR 111

DBE GOAL: 5.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW
 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

CODE	COUNTY: FLOYD BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY		\$ 1,093,664.00			
		Indiana	812-941-7895				
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE		\$ 676,337.89			
		Indiana	812-280-4404				
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC	CLARKSVILLE		\$ 905,560.00			
		Indiana	812-282-1349				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 26

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT B -33401-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005957

DBE GOAL: 10.00

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 360,000.00

CALL: 440

ROUTE: SR 48

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 48, 3.04 MILES WEST OF SR 101

CODE	COUNTY: RIPLEY BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
26-4305155	R A MYERS CONSTRUCTION CO	MUNCIE Indiana	765-896-9704	\$ 265,825.35			
31-1323837	SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	WEST CHESTER Ohio	513-326-6000	\$ 367,213.06			
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 356,594.90			
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 296,629.76			
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 429,816.92			
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 397,875.78			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 27

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT B -33693-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0801064
 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK REPLACEMENT

DBE GOAL: 7.00
 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 868,000.00
 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

CALL: 450

ROUTE:
 LOCATION: ON CR 600W OVER DOE CREEK

CODE	COUNTY: HANCOCK BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 724,085.30			
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 763,678.60			
35-1609544	SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-484-1500	\$ 758,965.17			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 28

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT B -34610-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173639, 1173640

DBE GOAL: 12.00

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 460

ROUTE: I-74

CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON I-74 OVER WALNUT FORK, 5.48 MILES EAST OF SR 32

COUNTY: MONTGOMERY
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
26-4305155	R A MYERS CONSTRUCTION CO	MUNCIE	765-896-9704	\$ 943,637.45			
		Indiana					
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND	219-474-6542	\$ 867,004.91			
		Indiana					
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE	812-280-4404	\$ 1,009,013.67			
		Indiana					
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS	317-284-1195	\$ 986,174.00			
		Indiana					

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 29

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT B -34787-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006462

DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 240,000.00

CALL: 470

ROUTE: 58

VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 58, OVER SINGER DITCH, 1.04 MILES NORTH OF SR 67

CODE	COUNTY: KNOX BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 282,237.92			
35-1801998	CLR INC	VINCENNES Indiana	812-886-0360	\$ 207,345.10			
35-1878024	RAGLE INC	NEWBURGH Indiana	812-853-9558	\$ 155,065.50			
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 225,925.00			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 30

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT B -34949-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173300

DBE GOAL: 4.00

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION OR REPAIR

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 672,500.00

CALL: 480

ROUTE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SHERMAN DRIVE, 0.42 MILE SOUTH OF WASHINGTON STREET
 AND 300 FEET NORTH OF EAST PLEASANT RUN PARKWAY SOUTH DRIVE

COUNTY: MARION

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
26-4305155	R A MYERS CONSTRUCTION CO	MUNCIE Indiana	765-896-9704	\$ 602,002.94			
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC	BOGGSTOWN Indiana	317-835-2254	\$ 640,323.65			
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 673,730.90			
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND Indiana	219-474-6542	\$ 630,855.20			
35-1609544	SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-484-1500	\$ 587,176.63			
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 782,777.46			
37-1047512	HALVERSON CONSTRUCTION CO INC	SPRINGFIELD Illinois	217-753-0027	\$ 842,893.82			
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 707,088.34			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 32

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT B -35603-B

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500908

DBE GOAL: 9.00

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 494

ROUTE: 161st STREET

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON 161ST STREET OVER COOL CREEK

CODE	COUNTY: HAMILTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC	BLOOMINGTON		\$ 1,757,243.11			
		Indiana	812-336-4452				
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 1,661,457.95			
		Indiana	317-284-1195				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 33

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT B -35729-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1382078

DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 224,500.00

CALL: 500

ROUTE: 65

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON I-65 OVER VERMONT STREET, 1.29 MILES NORTH OF I-70

COUNTY: MARION
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
37-1047512	HALVERSON CONSTRUCTION CO INC	SPRINGFIELD		\$ 184,438.00			
		Illinois	217-753-0027				
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 230,572.00			
		Indiana	317-284-1195				

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 34

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT M -35719-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1382011

MBE GOAL: 7.00

DESCRIPTION: SLIDE CORRECTION

WBE GOAL: 5.00

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 446,900.00

CALL: 540

ROUTE:

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE SEYMOUR AND
 VINCENNES DISTRICT

COUNTY: VARIOUS

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1801998	CLR INC	VINCENNES Indiana	812-886-0360	\$ 598,518.40			
52-2379754	GEOSTABILIZATION INTERNATIONAL	GRAND JUNCTION Colorado	970-210-6170	\$ 327,161.94			

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 APPARENT BID RESULTS
 FOR THE LETTING OF August 07, 2013

PAGE: 36

DATE: 08/07/13

CONTRACT T -34998-A

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173686

DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: PAVEMENT MARKINGS, RUMBLE STRIPES

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 590

ROUTE:

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS ROUTES THROUGHOUT THE FORT WAYNE DISTRICT

COUNTY: VARIOUS
 BIDDER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
25-1584843	SURFACE PREPARATION TECHNOLOGI	MECHANICSBURG		\$ 240,986.00			
		Pennsylvania	717-697-1450				
35-2040834	GRIDLOCK TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC	INDIANAPOLIS		\$ 481,996.00			
		Indiana	317-541-2727				