INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

PAGE: 1A
DATE: 07/24/12

CONTRACT IR-30853-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0715017

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION

DBE GOAL: 6.00
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 27,974,700.00

CALL: 221 ROUTE: 25 LAPORTE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 25 FROM 0.61 MILE EAST OF CR 325W TO 0.10 MILE EAST OF
SR 29
COUNTY: CASS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE/FAX AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE  LOW REMARKS
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE I | $1,857,922.12 | I I
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION I I I I I
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE | | $ 1,344,466.38 | | |
| SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION | I I I I
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I1 LLC | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $20,392,835.51 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN | I | |
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I1 LLC | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | No Bid | R I
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN | I I I
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I1 LLC | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 5,539,611.93 | R | |
| SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION | IN | I I I
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | SOUTH BEND  574-288-8321 | $19,641,994.77 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | | |
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SOUTH BEND  574-288-8321 No Bid R
SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION IN
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION SOUTH BEND  574-288-8321 $ 6,047,132.45 R
SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION IN
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD 574-658-4166 | $20,154,737.08 | R | I
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | | |
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD 574-658-4166 | $ 5,272,452.39 | R | |
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN I | | |
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD 574-658-4166 | $ 6,025,099.29 | R | |
| SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION | IN I I I I
35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC | FORT WAYNE  260-478-1548 | $19,369,148.16 | R | X | AWARD
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | | | DBE 6.18%
35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC | FORT WAYNE  260-478-1548 | No Bid | R |
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN | | | |
35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC | FORT WAYNE  260-478-1548 | $ 5,405,366.15 | R | X |
| SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION | IN I I I I
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758 | $19,644,606.09 | R | I

| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I I I



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1B
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/24/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT IR-30853-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0715017 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 27,974,700.00
CALL: 221 ROUTE: 25 LAPORTE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 25 FROM 0.61 MILE EAST OF CR 325W TO 0.10 MILE EAST OF
SR 29
COUNTY: CASS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE/FAX AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE  LOW REMARKS
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758 | $ 5,224,207.40 | R | I
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN I I I I
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758 | $ 5,922,833.77 | R | |
| SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION | IN I I I I
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $19,770,375.14 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN I | | I
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | No Bid | R I
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN | I I I
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | LAFAYETTE 765-772-7500 | $ 5,853,720.45 | R | |
| SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION | IN | I I I
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $19,196,522.16 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | M I I | I
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 5,144,297.23 | R | I
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | M I I I I
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 5,625,699.90 | R | I
| SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION | M1 | I I |
38-3082681 | D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC | LEROY 231-768-4403 | $18,608,894.07 | R | I
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | M1 | | | |
38-3082681 | D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC | LEROY 231-768-4403 | $ 5,665,388.15 | R | I
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | M | | | |
38-3082681 | D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC | LEROY 231-768-4403 | $ 6,388,219.60 | R | |
| SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION | M | | | |

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDS 1S DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF FOLLOWING COMBINATIONS OF SECTION BIDS, AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE
OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE:

SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0002; OR
SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0003..

THE LOWEST RANKING AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001  + SECTION 0003 + PVFM 0003

$19,369,148.16 + $5,405,366.15 + $1,344,466.38 = $26,118,980.69
LOW BIDDER CONTRACT AMOUNT = $24,774,514_31



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

PAGE: 2A
DATE: 07/31/12

CONTRACT IR-33739-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500449

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION

DBE GOAL: 10.00
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 94,540,800.00 *

CALL: 241 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM CARMICHAEL ROAD TO GREENE/MONROE
COUNTY LINE
COUNTY: GREENE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE/FAX AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE  LOW REMARKS
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE I | $ 2,516,795.81 | I |
| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | I I I I
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE I | $ 3,505,522.14 | I I
| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | I | | |
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE | | $ 310,704.35 | | |
| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION I I | | |
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE | | $ 485,247.67 | | |
| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION | | | | I
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I1 LLC | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $80,668,194.87 | R | I
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I I I
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I1 LLC | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $15,465,020.44 | R | |
| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | IN I I I I
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I1 LLC | CROWN POINT 219-661-2450 | No Bid | R | |
| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | IN | | | |
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I1 LLC | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 1,531,285.26 | R | |
| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION | IN | I I |
27-0887958 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 11 LLC | CROWN POINT 219-661-2450 | No Bid | R | I
| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION | IN I I I I
32-0289822 | KOLB GRADING LLC | ST CHARLES  636-441-0200 | $81,981,991.60 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | MO I | I I
32-0289822 | KOLB GRADING LLC ST CHARLES  636-441-0200 $13,060,179.52 | R
| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | MO
32-0289822 | KOLB GRADING LLC ST CHARLES  636-441-0200 No Bid R
| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION MO
32-0289822 | KOLB GRADING LLC ST CHARLES  636-441-0200 $ 1,705,654.64 | R
| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION MO
32-0289822 | KOLB GRADING LLC ST CHARLES  636-441-0200 No Bid R
| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION MO
34-0907180 | E S WAGNER COMPANY | OREGON 419-691-8651 | $80,148,166.40 | R | |

| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | OH I I I |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 2B
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/31/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT IR-33739-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500449 DBE GOAL: 10.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 94,540,800.00 *
CALL: 241 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM CARMICHAEL ROAD TO GREENE/MONROE
COUNTY LINE
COUNTY: GREENE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE/FAX AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE  LOW REMARKS
34-0907180 | E S WAGNER COMPANY | OREGON 419-691-8651 | $13,232,885.75 | R | I
| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | OH I I I I
34-0907180 | E S WAGNER COMPANY | OREGON 419-691-8651 | No Bid | R | I
| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | OH I I I I
34-0907180 | E S WAGNER COMPANY | OREGON 419-691-8651 | $ 1,760,651.66 | R | |
| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION | OH I I I I
34-0907180 | E S WAGNER COMPANY | OREGON 419-691-8651 | $ 1,654,449.10 | R | |
| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION | OH | I I |
34-4456871 | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC | ARCHBOLD 419-445-1015 | $89,624,109.70 | R | I
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | OH I I I I
34-4456871 | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC | ARCHBOLD 419-445-1015 | $13,581,383.94 | R | |
| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | OH I I I I
34-4456871 | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC | ARCHBOLD 419-445-1015 | No Bid | R | |
| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | OH I | | I
34-4456871 | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC | ARCHBOLD 419-445-1015 | $ 1,766,850.17 | R | I
| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION | OH I | I I
34-4456871 | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC | ARCHBOLD 419-445-1015 | No Bid | R | I
| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION | OH I I I I
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS 317-634-5561 | $92,135,456.17 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I I I
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS 317-634-5561 | $15,651,827.73 | R | I
| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | IN | I I |
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS 317-634-5561 | No Bid | R | |
| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | IN | | | |
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS 317-634-5561 | $ 1,762,716.10 | R | |
| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION | IN | | | |
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | INDIANAPOLIS 317-634-5561 | No Bid | R | |
| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION | IN | | I I
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON  812-336-4452 | $92,676,086.56 | R | |

| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I I I



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 2C
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/31/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT IR-33739-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500449 DBE GOAL: 10.00
DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER™S ESTIMATE: $ 94,540,800.00 *
CALL: 241 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM CARMICHAEL ROAD TO GREENE/MONROE
COUNTY LINE
COUNTY: GREENE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE/FAX AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE  LOW REMARKS

35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON  812-336-4452 | $13,590,578.68 | R | I

| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | IN I I I I
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON  812-336-4452 | No Bid | R | I

| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | IN I | | |
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON  812-336-4452 | $ 1,795,851.86 | R | |

| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION | IN I I I I
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON  812-336-4452 | No Bid | R | |

| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION | IN | I I |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS 812-579-5248 | $82,867,222.51 | R | I

| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I I I
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS 812-579-5248 | $12,618,796.06 | R | |

| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | IN I I I I
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS 812-579-5248 | No Bid | R | |

| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | IN I I I I
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS 812-579-5248 | $ 1,624,536.89 | R | I

| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION | IN I I I I
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS 812-579-5248 | No Bid | R | |

| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION | IN I I I I
35-2040801 | GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC | CLARKSVILLE  812-282-1349 | $73,122,244.33 | R | X | AWARD

| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | | | DBE 10.10%
35-2040801 | GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC | CLARKSVILLE 812-282-1349 | $14,935,535.50 | R | X | AWARD

| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | IN I | | |
35-2040801 | GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC | CLARKSVILLE 812-282-1349 | No Bid | R | |

| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | IN I | I I
35-2040801 | GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC | CLARKSVILLE 812-282-1349 | $ 1,905,034.51 | R | X | AWARD

| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION | IN | | | |
35-2040801 | GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC | CLARKSVILLE 812-282-1349 | No Bid | R | |

| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION | IN | I I |
36-4518443 | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSOCIATES LL | CHICAGO 773-444-3474 | $108,697,564.10 | R | I

| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | I I I I |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT IR-33739-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500449

PHONE/FAX

PAGE: 2D
DATE: 07/31/12

DBE GOAL: 10.00

ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
VINCENNES DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

$ 94,540,800.00 *

TYPE LOW REMARKS

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION
CALL: 241 ROUTE: 69
LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM CARMICHAEL ROAD TO GREENE/MONROE
COUNTY LINE
COUNTY: GREENE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS

36-4518443 | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSOCIATES LL | CHICAGO

| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | IL
36-4518443 | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSOCIATES LL | CHICAGO

| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | IL
36-4518443 | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSOCIATES LL | CHICAGO

| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION | IL
36-4518443 | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSOCIATES LL | CHICAGO

| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION | IL
43-0626545 | FRED WEBER INC | MARYLAND HTS

| SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS | MO
43-0626545 | FRED WEBER INC | MARYLAND HTS

| SECTION 0002 PR 69 & RAMPS PCCP OPTION | MO
43-0626545 | FRED WEBER INC | MARYLAND HTS

| SECTION 0003 PR 69 & RAMPS HMA OPTION | MO
43-0626545 | FRED WEBER INC | MARYLAND HTS

| SECTION 0004 SR 445 PCCP OPTION | MO
43-0626545 | FRED WEBER INC | MARYLAND HTS

| SECTION 0005 SR 445 HMA OPTION |

MO

314-344-0070

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDS
VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE:

SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0002, AND SECTION 0004; OR
SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0002, AND SECTION 0005; OR
SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004; OR
SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0005.

THE LOWEST RANKING AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001 +

SECTION 0002

+ PVFM 0002

IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF FOLLOWING COMBINATIONS OF SECTION

+ SECTION 0004

BIDS, AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT

+ PVFM 0004

= $73,122,244 .33 + $14,935,535.50 + $2,516,795.81 + $1,905,034.51 + $310,704.35 = $92,790,314.50

LOW BIDDER CONTRACT AMOUNT = $89,962,814.34

*ERRANTLY READ AS “NO BIDS BELOW ENGINEER”S ESTIMATE” AT LETTING.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 3
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/31/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT 1R-34266-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005443 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  1,498,500.00
CALL: 251 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON TAYLOR RIDGE ROAD, 1.6 MILES NORTH OF SR 58, 3.5 MILES
WEST OF SR 45 AND 3.7 MILES EAST OF US 231
COUNTY: GREENE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
20-1237324 | KERNS EXCAVATING LLC | BICKNELL | $ 1,778,996.68 |R | |
I | Indiana 812-291-5156 | | | |
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 1,756,227.90 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |
35-1582525 | JERRY AIGNER CONSTRUCTION | BOONVILLE | $ 1,798,558.85 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-897-5815 | | | |
35-1801998 | CLR INC | VINCENNES | $ 1,892,757.96 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-886-0360 | | | |
35-2040801 | GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC | CLARKSVILLE | $ 1,926,000.00 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-282-1349 | | | |

38-3806996 | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 1,594,560.00 |[R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 317-284-1195 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.



CONTRACT IR-34937-A
DESCRIPTION:

CLARK

CALL: 261 ROUTE: 265
LOCATION:
COUNTY:
CODE BIDDER

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900254
DESIGN BUILD

ADDRESS

ON 1-265 SALEM ROAD BRIDGE OVER 1-265

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
SEYMOUR DISTRICT

9.00
$

3,470,0

REMARKS

PAGE: 4
DATE: 07/31/12

00.00

CROWN POINT
Indiana

COLUMBUS
Indiana

NEW ALBANY
Indiana

JEFFERSONVILLE
Indiana

35-1878024 | RAGLE INC

NEWBURGH
Indiana

35-2040801 | GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION

INC

CLARKSVILLE
Indiana

AWARD



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 5
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT R -30261-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9917043 DBE GOAL: 10.00
DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 2,170,000.00
CALL: 281 ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CR 11A AND CR 56 WEST FROM 1-69 TO CR 17

COUNTY: DEKALB

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 2,379,380.01 |R | |
| | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | | |
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 1,884,320.00 |R | |
I | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | 1 1
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 1,866,645.60 |R 1 X1 AWARD
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 1 1 DBE 10.38%
35-2094565 | 3D COMPANY INC | MUNCIE | $ 1,939,383.99 |[R | |
| | Indiana 765-288-3326 | | | |
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK | $ 1,894,001.46 |[R | |
| | Michigan 269-965-1207 | | | |
62-1492793 | API CONSTRUCTION CORP | LAOTTO | $ 2,199,799.32 |R | |

| | Indiana 260-897-2743 | | 11



CONTRACT R

CALL: 291

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 6
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

-30422-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500405 DBE GOAL: 10.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER®"S ESTIMATE: $ 2,103,400.00
ROUTE: 27 GREENFIELD DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON US 27 FROM SR 28 TO 1.53 MILES NORTH OF SR 26/67
COUNTY: JAY RANDOLPH
BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
| BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 2,193,711.94 |R | |
| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | |
| E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 1,699,034.36 |[R | X | AWARD
I | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 1 1 DBE 10.01%
| L1 CA CONSTRUCTION | BERNE | $ 1,810,059.70 |R |

|
I | Indiana 260-344-5311 | | 11



CONTRACT R

CALL: 301

-31877-A

ROUTE: 144

LOCATION: ON CR 144 AT WHITELAND ROAD

COUNTY: JOHNSON
BIDDER

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810516
DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION

IMPROVEMENT, ROUNDABOUT

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

7.00
$

PAGE: 7
DATE: 07/25/12

1,291,900.00

REMARKS

GOSHEN
Indiana

| E & B PAVING INC

ANDERSON
Indiana

| CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS

INC

WHITESTOWN
Indiana

| RAGLE INC

NEWBURGH
Indiana

COLUMBUS
Indiana

| 3D COMPANY INC

MUNCIE
Indiana



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT R -31930-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710078
DESCRIPTION: SLIDE CORRECTION

CALL: 311 ROUTE: 145

LOCATION: ON SR 145 AT 10.2 MILES NORTH OF SR 37

COUNTY: PERRY
CODE BIDDER

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER®S ESTIMATE:
VINCENNES DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

0.00
$

PAGE: 8
DATE: 07/17/12

NONE BELOW

REMARKS

| NEWBURGH
| Indiana

| GRAND JUNCTION
| Colorado

| $
970-210-6170 |

167,369.00 |[R | |

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE - REJECTED, TO BE RESCOPED AND READVERTISED.

**FAILED TO SUBMIT A PERFORMANCE BOND WITH THE BID.

BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(1)-



CONTRACT R

CALL: 315

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

0.00
$

PAGE: 9
DATE: 07/26/12

130,000.00

REMARKS

-31931-C FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710198 DBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES, ENHANCEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT
LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ALONG GARDEN STREET, COLUMBIA STREET,
AND MIAMI AVENUE
COUNTY: CASS

BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

| PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 184,356.18 |[R | |
| | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | | |
| E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 204,689.63 [R | |
1 | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
| LEO BROWN CONSTRUCTION CO | LOGANSPORT | $ 184,084.19 |[R | X |
| | Indiana 574-753-2511 | | | |
| MOONROCK INC | ROME CITY | $ 194,281.54 |[R | |
| | Indiana 260-854-9000 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 10
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT R -32726-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900156, 0900158 DBE GOAL: 9.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 712,000.00
CALL: 321 ROUTE: 4 AND 23 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 4 FROM W CORP LINE TO E CORP LINE (RP 16+88 TO 17+70)
AND ON SR 23 FROM W PINE ST TO POT CR (RP 24+22 TO 25+10)
COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 537,161.15 |[R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | 11 DBE 9.19%
35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC | GRIFFITH | $ 663,238.86 |[R | |

I | Indiana 219-924-5900 | | 11



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 11
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT R -32827-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900128, 0900157 DBE GOAL: 9.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,014,000.00
CALL: 341 ROUTE: US 6 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 6 FROM SR 104 TO GEORGIA STREET

COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 962,480.61 |[R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | 11 DBE 9.04%
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 1,117,945.80 [R | |

I | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | 11
35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC | GRIFFITH | $ 1,118,230.56 |[R | |

I | Indiana 219-924-5900 | | 11



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 12
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT R -34105-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902320 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: SAFE ROUTE TO SCHOOL ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 145,620.00 *
CALL: 351 ROUTE: 234 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG VINE STREET FROM SR 234 TO KENARD ELEMENTRY SCHOOL

COUNTY: HENRY

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 204,300.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 148,816.21 |R | |
I | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 1 1
35-1151771 | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC | WHITESTOWN | $ 194,200.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 317-769-1900 | | 1 1

35-1606893 | OLCO INC | BATESVILLE | $ 144,607.70 |C | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 812-934-4574 | | 1 1
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 163,737.00 |[R | |
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |
35-2094565 | 3D COMPANY INC | MUNCIE | $ 188,916.30 |[R | |
| | Indiana 765-288-3326 | | | |

*READ AS ““NONE BELOW ENGINEER”S ESTIMATE” DUE TO APPARENT LOW BID BEING A CONDITIONAL BID.



CONTRACT R

CALL: 361

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

-34330-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005233 DBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, STREETSCAPE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON FOURTH STREET FROM FRANKLIN STREET TO JACKSON STREET

COUNTY: BARTHOLOMEW

6.00
$

PAGE: 13
DATE: 07/24/12

1,650,000.00

REMARKS

AWARD *
DBE 6.02%

BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW
| RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 1,778,000.00 |[R | X |
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
| DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 1,978,877.30 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |
| OLCO INC | BATESVILLE | $ 1,949,571.50 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-934-4574 | | | |
| MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 1,886,300.00 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.



CONTRACT R

CALL: 375

-34476-A

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173310

DESCRIPTION: SLIDE CORRECTION
ROUTE: US 50
LOCATION: ON US 50, 0.25 MILES WEST OF SR 262

COUNTY: DEARBORN

BIDDER

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $

PAGE:
DATE:

9.00
1,580,000.00

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

REMARKS

14
07/17/12

WEST CHESTER
Ohio

AURORA
Indiana

| DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR

INC

NORTH VERNON
Indiana

AWARD



CONTRACT R

CALL: 381

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER®S ESTIMATE:

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

.92 MILES NORTH

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

5.00
$

PAGE: 15
DATE: 07/17/12

1,609,000.00

REMARKS

AWARD *
DBE 5.06%

-34543-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173590
DESCRIPTION: CONCRETE PAVEMENT RESTORATION
ROUTE: 1-469
LOCATION: ON 1-469 FROM 3.99 MILES SOUTH OF US 30 TO
OF SR 37
COUNTY: ALLEN
BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE
| HARPER COMPANY | HEBRON
| | Kentucky 859-586-8890
| RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN
I | Indiana 574-875-5183
| BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE
| | Indiana 260-478-1990
| E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON
| | Indiana 765-643-5358
| PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC | ALBION
| | Indiana 260-636-3000

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 16
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/25/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT R -34604-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173736 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  83,000.00
CALL: 391 ROUTE: 5 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 5 OVER DAVIS LAKE DRAIN, 0.3 MILE SOUTH OF US 33

COUNTY: NOBLE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1004746 | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM | $ 151,800.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-883-6644 | | | |
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 170,960.60 |[R | |
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |

35-2097364 | INDIANA RELINE INC | SULPHUR SPRINGS | $ 133,235.00 |R | X1 AWARD *
| | Indiana 765-533-5040 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



CONTRACT R

CALL: 401

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

0.00
$

PAGE: 17
DATE: 07/26/12

310,170.00

REMARKS

-34699-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173666
DESCRIPTION: SAFE ROUTE TO SCHOOL
ROUTE:
LOCATION: MISHAWAKA INFRASTRUCTURE
COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH
BIDDER ADDRESS
| RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN
| | Indiana
| PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD
| | Indiana
| GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC | GARY
| | Indiana
] WALSH & KELLY INC | GRIFFITH
| | Indiana
| NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC | BRISTOL
| | Indiana
| LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I | LAPORTE
| | Indiana
| PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC | ALBION
| | Indiana
| SELGE CONSTRUCTION CO INC | NILES

| Michigan



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 18
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT R -34761-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297142 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: AUXILIARY LANES ENGINEER®"S ESTIMATE: $ 114,000.00
CALL: 411 ROUTE: 14 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 14 FROM 4.7 MILES EAST IF SR 9 TO 4.82 MILES EAST
OF SR 9
COUNTY: WHITLEY
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 143,352.12 |R | |
| | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | | |
35-1016737 | WAYNE ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | FORT WAYNE | $ 117,802.55 |R | |
I | Indiana 260-747-7531 | | 1 1
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 103,108.00 |R 1 X1 AWARD
| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | 1 1
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 114,629.76 |[R | |
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | | |
35-1185040 | NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC | BRISTOL | $ 132,733.80 |[R | |
| | Indiana 574-848-4437 | | | |
35-2094565 | 3D COMPANY INC | MUNCIE | $ 164,926.93 [R | |

| | Indiana 765-288-3326 | | 11



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 19
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT R -34801-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902330 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT RAILROAD WORK ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ NONE BELOW
CALL: 421 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON HOOSIER HERITAGE PORT AUTHORITY FROM FISHERS
TO THE INDIANA STATE FAIRGROUNDS

COUNTY: HAMILTON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

NO BIDS RECEIVED. AT THIS TIME, A DECISION HAS NOT BEEN MADE REGARDING READVERTISEMENT.



CONTRACT R

CALL: 431

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 20
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

-34865-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297223 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: WEDGE AND LEVEL ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 87,000.00
ROUTE: 1-74 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON 1-74, 4.24 MILES EAST OF SR 1

COUNTY: DEARBORN

BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
| BARRETT PAVING MATERIALS | MIDDLETOWN | $ 86,106.74 [R | |
| | Ohio 513-422-4662 | | 11
| PAUL H ROHE COMPANY | AURORA | $ 79,283.13 [R | |
I | Indiana 812-926-1471 | | 11
| DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON 3 73,872.25 |R X AWARD

|
I | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 21
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT R -35162-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297422 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: CENTERLINE AND EDGE LINE RUMBLE STRIPES INSTALLATIO ENGINEER®"S ESTIMATE: $ NONE BELOW
CALL: 441 ROUTE: 231 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 231 FROM 0.54 MILE NORTH OF 1-74 TO
5.48 MILES NORTH OF SR 28

COUNTY: MONTGOMERY TIPPECANOE
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-2040834 | GRIDLOCK TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 596,585.32 |R | | REJECTED *
| | Indiana 317-541-2727 | | | |

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE - REJECTED, TO BE RESCOPED AND READVERTISED FOR AUGUST 8, 2012.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 22
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/24/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT RS-31596-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710123 DBE GOAL: 7.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  7,550,000.00
CALL: 471 ROUTE: 70 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON 1-70 FROM 0.56 MILE EAST OF LITTLE POINT ROAD TO
0.5 MILE WEST OF SR 39

COUNTY: MORGAN HENDRICKS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 7,290,000.00 [R | X | AWARD
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | 11 DBE 7.06%
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 8,684,514.00 [R | |
I | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 11
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 8,445,000.00 [R | |

| | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT RS-31923-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900089
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE
CALL: 481 ROUTE: SR 2

PAGE: 23
DATE: 07/17/12

DBE GOAL: 9.00

ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,040,000.00
LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 2 FROM SR 39 TO BURSON AVENUE

COUNTY: LAPORTE

PHONE AMOUNT OF BID

| $ 1,088,256.10
574-875-5183 |

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN
| | Indiana
35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC | GRIFFITH
| | Indiana

| $ 1,315,700.56
219-924-5900 |

TYPE LOW REMARKS

IR | X | AWARD *

| 11 DBE 9.00%
IR 1 1

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN

15% OF THE ENGINEER®S ESTIMATE.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 24
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/24/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT RS-32689-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710120 DBE GOAL: 7.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 12,300,000.00
CALL: 491 ROUTE: 70 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON I-70 FROM 0.98 MILE EAST OF SR 46 TO SR 59
COUNTY: CLAY VIGO
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 10,260,000.00 |[R | |

| | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 11,279,439.50 |[R | |

| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |
35-2126716 | WABASH VALLEY ASPHALT CO LLC | TERRE HAUTE | $ 9,898,873.82 |R | X1 AWARD

| | Indiana 812-232-6094 | | | | DBE 7.00%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE

CONTRACT RS-32950-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901680
CALL: 501 ROUTE: 24
1-69
COUNTY: ALLEN

CODE BIDDER

ADDRESS

| Indiana

DBE GOAL:

ENGINEER®S ESTIMATE:
FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON US 24 FROM 0.59 MILES WEST OF 1-69 TO 0.34 MILES EAST OF

PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE

9.00
$

PAGE: 25
DATE: 07/17/12

521,000.00

REMARKS

| ANDERSON
| Indiana

| $ 537,193.93 |R

AWARD *
DBE 9.00%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS

THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 26
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012
MBE GOAL: 7.00

CONTRACT RS-34058-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172461 WBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 78,000.00
CALL: 511 ROUTE: VARIOUS SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT PARKING LOT OF ABERDEEN UNIT

COUNTY: OHIO

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0844079 | PAUL H ROHE COMPANY | AURORA | $ 53,958.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-926-1471 | | | |
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 34,930.00 |R 1 X1 AWARD
I | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | 1 1 MBE 7.01% MBE 5.01%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 27
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012
MBE GOAL: 7.00

CONTRACT RS-34059-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172451 WBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 38,000.00
CALL: 521 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT PARKING LOT FOR INDIANA STATE POLICE IN VERSAILLES

COUNTY: RIPLEY

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0844079 | PAUL H ROHE COMPANY | AURORA | $ 55,580.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-926-1471 | | | |
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 38,660.00 |R 1 X1 AWARD *
I | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | 1 1 MBE 12.42% WBE 5.04%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 28
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT RS-34168-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173037 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, ULTRATHIN BONDED WEARING COURSE ENGINEER®"S ESTIMATE: $ 590,000.00
CALL: 531 ROUTE: 47 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 47 FROM US 421 TO 4.57 MILES EAST OF US 421

COUNTY: BOONE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 418,648.72 |[R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 11 DBE 6.07%
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 493,000.00 [R | |

I | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | 11



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 29
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT RS-34542-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173589 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, THIN HMA OVERLAY ENGINEER®"S ESTIMATE: $ 263,000.00
CALL: 541 ROUTE: SR 114 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 114 FROM 0.18 MILE WEST OF SR 13 TO 0.73 MILE EAST OF
SR 13
COUNTY: WABASH
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD | $ 314,457.73 |R | |
| | Indiana 574-658-4166 | | | |
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 322,214.74 |R | |
I | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | 1 1
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 267,961.24 |R 1 X1 AWARD *
| | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 1 1
35-1505753 | GAUNT & SON ASPHALT INC | WABASH | $ 370,364.80 [R | |
| | Indiana 260-563-1821 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 30
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT RS-34544-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173591 DBE GOAL: 4.00
DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT ULTRATHIN BONDED WEARING COURSE ENGINEER®"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,100,000.00
CALL: 551 ROUTE: 69 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON 1-69 FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF US 6 TO 0.78 MILE SOUTH OF
SR 4
COUNTY: DEKALB

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 795,418.12 |R 1 X | AWARD
| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | | DBE 4.02%

35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON | $ 835,424.17 |R | |

I | Indiana 765-643-5358 | | 11



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT B -29052-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0011140

DESCRIPTION: NEW BRIDGE

CALL: 581 ROUTE: SR 1

LOCATION: ON SR 1 OVER HAMILTON LAKE SPILLWAY

COUNTY: STEUBEN
CODE BIDDER

ADDRESS

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER®S ESTIMATE:
FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

9.00
$

PAGE: 31
DATE: 07/17/12

793,000.00

REMARKS

| ALBION
| Indiana

| INDIANAPOLIS
| Indiana

| $

AWARD *
DBE 9.18%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



CONTRACT B

CALL: 585

-30069-B

DESCRIPTION:
ROUTE:
LOCATION:

COUNTY:
BIDDER

LAKE

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600753
BRIDGE REHABILITATION OR REPAIR

ON POPLAR LANE OVER HART DITCH

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER®S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

8.00
$

PAGE: 32
DATE: 07/17/12

1,027,000.00

REMARKS

DBE 8.09%

| RAUSCH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

IN

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW

ADDRESS PHONE

MICHIGAN CITY

Indiana 219-879-7321

GARY

Indiana 219-938-0860

ELBURN

1llinois 630-232-7280

GLENDALE HEIGHTS

1llinois 630-539-1200

BROADVIEW

11linois 708-865-7300
BIDDER

IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

PAGE: 33
DATE: 07/17/12

CONTRACT B -30918-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 5356006 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER®"S ESTIMATE: $ 762,000.00
CALL: 591 ROUTE: 55 LAPORTE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 55 OVER KNIGHT DITCH, 6.28 MILES NORTH OF SR 14
COUNTY: NEWTON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
26-1710683 | ELLAS CONSTRUCTION CO LLC | MUNSTER | $ 1,112,268.29 |R | |
| | Indiana 888-746-0983 | | | |
26-3919039 | TONN AND BLANK CONSTRUCTION LL | MICHIGAN CITY | $ 1,036,931.57 |R | |
I | Indiana 219-879-7321 | | 1 1
35-1035122 | GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC | GARY | $ 979,700.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 219-887-5233 | | 1 1
35-1106884 | ELLAS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC | GARY | $ 889,799.18 |[R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 219-938-0860 | | | | DBE 6.04%
35-1523985 | YATES CONSTRUCTION INC | KENTLAND | $ 900,485.05 [R | |
| | Indiana 219-474-6542 | | | |
35-1817530 | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC | ALBION | $ 913,394.73 |R | |
| | Indiana 260-636-3000 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 1,003,328.10 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | 1 1
36-0872360 | ALBIN CARLSON & CO | ADDISON | $ 1,134,660.36 |R | |
| | 1llinois 630-785-4000 | | | |
38-2675420 | ANLAAN CORPORATION | SPRING LAKE | $ 965,622.60 |R | |
| | Michigan 616-846-8442 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



CONTRACT B

CALL: 601

-31508-A

DESCRIPTION:
ROUTE:
LOCATION:

COUNTY:

BIDDER

OWEN

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0100478
NEW BRIDGE
231

ON US 231, 1.05 MILES NORTH OF SR 67

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:

ENGINEER®S ESTIMATE:
CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

9.00
$

PAGE: 34
DATE: 07/17/12

818,000.00

REMARKS

| CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS

INC

WHITESTOWN
Indiana

| DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR

INC

NORTH VERNON
Indiana

| RAGLE INC

NEWBURGH
Indiana

AWARD *
DBE 9.33%

| HIS CONSTRUCTORS

INC

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.



CONTRACT B

CALL: 611

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
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DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

T

YPE LOW

10.00
$

PAGE: 35
DATE: 07/26/12

671,300.00

REMARKS

AWARD

-33054-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800777
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT
ROUTE:
LOCATION: ON CR 1100N OVER LAKE FREEMAN CANAL

COUNTY: CARROLL

BIDDER ADDRESS
| RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION GOSHEN
| Indiana
| JACK ISOM CONSTRUCTION CO REYNOLDS
| Indiana
| YATES CONSTRUCTION INC KENTLAND
| Indiana
| PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC ALBION
| Indiana
| ANLAAN CORPORATION SPRING LAKE
| Michigan
| HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC INDIANAPOLIS
| Indiana

*APPLICATION FOR PREQUALIFICATION RENEWAL WAS DENIED.

BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(2).-



CONTRACT B

CALL: 621

-33713-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO.

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK RE
ROUTE: PRAIRIE STREET

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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0902305
PLACEMENT

LOCATION: ON PRAIRIE STREET OVER ELKHART RIVER

COUNTY: ELKHART
BIDDER

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER®S ESTIMATE:

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

TYPE LOW

10.00
$

PAGE: 36
DATE: 07/17/12

2,240,000.00

REMARKS

| JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC |

LAPORTE
Indiana

| NORTHERN INDIANA CONSTRUCTION |

MISHAWAKA
Indiana

ELBURN
1llinois

SPRING LAKE
Michigan
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT B -33779-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005674 DBE GOAL: 8.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 625,000.00
CALL: 631 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON TYLER ROAD OVER YELLOW BANK CREEK

COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
32-0154474 | JCl1 BRIDGE GROUP INC | LAPORTE | $ 543,576.78 |R | |
| | Indiana 219-324-9393 | | | |
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 596,931.41 |R | |
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | 1 1
35-1339168 | LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 1 | LAPORTE | $ 492,709.68 |R 1 X1 AWARD
| | Indiana 219-393-5555 | | 1 1 DBE 8.62%
35-1690004 | NORTHERN INDIANA CONSTRUCTION | MISHAWAKA | $ 631,092.04 [R | 1
| | Indiana 574-256-1811 | | 1 1
35-1817530 | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC | ALBION | $ 578,951.51 [R | |
| | Indiana 260-636-3000 | | | |
38-2675420 | ANLAAN CORPORATION | SPRING LAKE | $ 739,130.27 |R | |

| | Michigan 616-846-8442 | | 11
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MBE GOAL:
CONTRACT M -31234-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800667 WBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: GUARDRAIL, MAINTENANCE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
CALL: 671 ROUTE: VARIOUS GREENFIELD DISTRICT
LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN MARION COUNTY
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW
35-0821499 | JAMES H DREW CORPORATION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 192,769.00 |R | X1
I | Indiana 317-876-3739 | | | |
35-2110733 | SPECIALTIES COMPANY LLC AND SU | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 211,129.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 317-594-0291 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.

PAGE: 38
DATE: 07/26/12

# 0~
oo
oo

167,000.00

REMARKS

AWARD *
MBE 0.00 WBE 6.14%

*AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN®"S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.
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MBE GOAL:

CONTRACT M -31235-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800668 WBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: GUARDRAIL MAINTENANCE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 681 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT GREENFIELD DISTRICT
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

35-0821499 | JAMES H DREW CORPORATION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 176,500.00 |R | X1

| | Indiana 317-876-3739 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.

PAGE: 39
DATE: 07/26/12

7.00

5.00

$ 144,000.00
REMARKS
AWARD *

MBE 0.00% WBE 8.67%

*AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN®"S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.
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MBE GOAL:
CONTRACT M -35014-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297276 WBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE, MOWING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 691 ROUTE: VARIOUS SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ALONG 1-265, 1-64, SR 62, AND I-65
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

35-1606893 | OLCO INC | BATESVILLE | $ 135,002.00 |R | |
[ | Indiana 812-934-4574 | [ [
35-1636776 | LINKEL COMPANY | BATESVILLE | $ 128,502.00 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-934-5190 | | | |
35-2045735 | J & M CONTRACTING INC | SHELBYVILLE | $ 79,999.50 [R | |
| | Indiana 317-979-7805 | | | |
61-1103168 | SWARTZ MOWING INC | OLYMPIA | $ 63,502.00 |R | X |
| | Kentucky 606-674-2971 | | | |

PAGE: 40
DATE: 07/26/12

©“ 0~
oo
oo

96,000.00

REMARKS

AWARD *
MBE 0.00% WBE 0.00%

*AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN®"S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT T -33218-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005496 DBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC HARDWARE MODERNIZATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 359,000.00
CALL: 721 ROUTE: 62 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG SR 62 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN CORYDON

COUNTY: HARRISON

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1675187 | HUMMEL ELECTRIC INC | EVANSVILLE | $ 379,980.55 |[R | X | AWARD *

| | Indiana 812-474-1500 | | 11 DBE 5.11%
90-0690005 | TC ELECTRIC INC | FRANKLIN |'$ 436,167.72 IR | |

I | Indiana 765-425-7109 | | 11

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT T -33244-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901527 DBE GOAL: 4.00
DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNALS MODERNIZATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ NONE BELOW
CALL: 731 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON UNION STREET FROM FRONT STREET TO DRAGOON TRAIL

COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
06-1675328 | MARTELL ELECTRIC LLC | SOUTH BEND | $ 2,115,362.44 |R | | REJECTED *
| | Indiana 574-271-5000 | | | |
35-1262778 | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 1,829,752.92 |R | | REJECTED *
I | Indiana 317-545-7641 | | 1 1
35-1657131 | MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC | PLYMOUTH | $ 1,849,757.37 |R | | REJECTED *
| | Indiana 574-936-8613 | | 1 1

*NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER®"S ESTIMATE - REJECTED. AT THIS TIME, A DECISION HAS NOT BEEN MADE REGARDING READVERTISEMENT.
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OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 08/10/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

CONTRACT T -33882-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172318, 1172320 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODERNIZATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 185,000.00
CALL: 741 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN THE TOWN OF AVON

COUNTY: HENDRICKS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
06-1675328 | MARTELL ELECTRIC LLC | SOUTH BEND | $ 343,443.90 |R | |
| | Indiana 574-271-5000 | | | |
35-0392360 | HOOSIER COMPANY INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 284,279.36 |R | |
I | Indiana 317-872-8125 | | 1 1
35-0821499 | JAMES H DREW CORPORATION | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 286,825.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 317-876-3739 | | 1 1
35-1262778 | MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 235,868.18 [R | |
| | Indiana 317-545-7641 | | 1 1
35-2046222 | MORPHEY CONSTRUCTION INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 229,038.89 |R 1 X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 317-356-9250 | | | |
62-1339540 | HAWK ENTERPRISES INC | CROWN POINT | $ 290,579.40 |R | |
| | Indiana 219-662-8090 | | | |
90-0690005 | TC ELECTRIC INC | FRANKLIN | $ 307,981.40 |R | |
| | Indiana 765-425-7109 | | 1 1

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.
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CONTRACT T -34232-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172195 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: PAVEMENT MARKINGS ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ NONE BELOW
CALL: 751 ROUTE: VARIOUS GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

COUNTY: VARIOUS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1983873 | M A S MARKERS INC | LEBANON | $ 393,905.80 |R 1 X | REJECTED *
| | Indiana 317-769-7200 | | | |

*AWARD OF JULY 18, 2012 RESCINDED. NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER®S ESTIMATE - REJECTED, TO BE RESCOPED AND READVERTISED.



CONTRACT T

CALL: 761

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 45
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 07/17/12
FOR THE LETTING OF July 11, 2012

-34473-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005900 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: SIGN MODERNIZATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  NONE BELOW
ROUTE: VARIOUS VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON VARIOUS STREETS IN BICKNELL

COUNTY: KNOX

BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
| ROADSAFE HOLDINGS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 147,837.20 |R | | IRREGULAR *
| | Indiana 317-780-1825 | | | |
| HRAY LLC | HODGENVILLE | $ 199,995.90 |R | | REJECTED **
| | Kentucky 270-765-8173 | | | |
| COLLINS & HERMANN INC | ST LOUIS | $ 145,199.55 |R | | REJECTED **
| | Missouri 314-869-8000 | | | |

*FAILED TO SUBMIT A PERFORMANCE BOND AND POWER OF ATTORNEY LETTER WITH THE BID. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(1).-

**NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER®"S ESTIMATE - REJECTED, TO BE RESCOPED AND READVERTISED.



CONTRACT T

CALL: 771
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-34678-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1006680 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: SIGN MODERNIZATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 232,000.00
ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN THE CITY OF RICHMOND
IN GREENFIELD DISTRICT
COUNTY: WAYNE

BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
| HRAY LLC | HODGENVILLE | $ 199,966.00 |R | |
| | Kentucky 270-765-8173 | | | |
| COLLINS & HERMANN INC | ST LOUIS | $ 193,014.40 |R 1 X1 AWARD
| | Missouri 314-869-8000 | | | |
| TC ELECTRIC INC | FRANKLIN | $ 225,366.00 |R |

|
I | Indiana 765-425-7109 | | 11





